
Bid Code Make Model
Year or Current 

Production 
Year

Body style Trim Level Drive

C1 Chevorlet Malibu 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A
C1A Chevorlet Malibu 2026 Sedan LS FWD No Bid No Bid No Bid
C1B Chevorlet Malibu 2026 Sedan RS FWD No Bid No Bid No Bid
C1D Chevorlet Malibu 2026 Sedan 1LT FWD No Bid No Bid No Bid
C1C Chevorlet Malibu 2026 Sedan 2LT FWD No Bid No Bid No Bid
C2 Chevrolet Trax 1.2L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.2L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.2L Turbo Engine N/A N/A

C2A Chevrolet Trax 2026 Cross LS FWD 20,847.00$          No Bid 21,705.00$                                  
C2B Chevrolet Trax 2026 Cross 1RS FWD 22,248.00$          No Bid 22,231.00$                                  

C2AC Chevrolet Trax 2026 Cross LT FWD 22,248.00$          No Bid 22,754.00$                                  
C3 Chevrolet Equinox 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 1.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A

C3A Chevrolet Equinox 2026 SUV LT (1LT) FWD 25,632.00$          No Bid 25,615.00$                                  
C3B Chevrolet Equinox 2026 SUV RS (1 RS) FWD 29,698.00$          No Bid 29,680.00$                                  
C3C Chevrolet Equinox 2026 SUV LT (2LT) AWD 27,483.00$          No Bid 27,463.00$                                  
C3D Chevrolet Equinox 2026 SUV RS (2RS) AWD 31,504.00$          No Bid 31,528.00$                                  
C4 Chevrolet Traverse 2.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 2.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A 2.5L Turbo Engine N/A N/A

C4A Chevrolet Traverse 2026 SUV LS FWD No Bid No Bid No Bid
C4B Chevrolet Traverse 2026 SUV LT FWD 36,553.00$          No Bid 36,536.00$                                  
C4C Chevrolet Traverse 2026 SUV LS AWD No Bid No Bid No Bid
C4D Chevrolet Traverse 2026 SUV LT AWD 38,401.00$          No Bid 38,384.00$                                  
C5 Chevrolet Trailblazer 1.2L Turbo Engine 1.3L Turbo Engine N/A 1.2L Turbo Engine 1.3L Turbo Engine N/A 1.2L Turbo Engine 1.3L Turbo Engine N/A

C5A Chevrolet Trailblazer 2026 SUV LS FWD 21,416.00$          21,811.00$          No Bid No Bid 21,570.00$                                  21,919.00$                                  
C5B Chevrolet Trailblazer 2026 SUV LT FWD 22,537.00$          22,931.80$          No Bid No Bid 22,691.00$                                  23,040.00$                                  
C5C Chevrolet Trailblazer 2026 SUV LS AWD No Bid 23,284.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid 23,438.00$                                  
C5D Chevrolet Trailblazer 2026 SUV LT AWD No Bid 24,404.80$          No Bid No Bid No Bid 24,559.00$                                  
C6 Chevrolet Blazer 2.0L Turbo engine 3.6L V6 engine N/A 2.0L Turbo engine 3.6L V6 engine N/A 2.0L Turbo engine 3.6L V6 engine N/A

C6A Chevrolet Blazer 2026 SUV LT FWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35,685.00$                                  39,728.00$                                  
C6B Chevrolet Blazer 2026 SUV LT AWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 38,180.00$                                  42,223.00$                                  
C7 Chevrolet Tahoe 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8

C7A Chevrolet Tahoe 2026 SUV Commercial RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C7B Chevrolet Tahoe 2026 SUV LS RWD 56,186.40$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55,367.00$                                        No Bid No Bid
C7C Chevrolet Tahoe 2026 SUV LT RWD 58,934.40$              61,184.40$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 58,917.00$                                        63,752.00$                                        No Bid
C7D Chevrolet Tahoe 2026 SUV Commercial 4X4 56,827.60$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 56,810.00$                                        No Bid No Bid
C7E Chevrolet Tahoe 2026 SUV LS 4X4 58,934.40$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 58,917.00$                                        No Bid No Bid
C7F Chevrolet Tahoe 2026 SUV LT 4X4 61,682.40$              63,932.40$              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 61,665.00$                                        66,611.00$                                        No Bid
C8 Chevrolet Suburban 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8 5.3L V8 3.0 Duramax 6.2L V8

C8A Chevrolet Suburban 2026 SUV Commercial RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8B Chevrolet Suburban 2026 SUV LS RWD 58,461.40$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 58,444.00$                                  No Bid No Bid
C8C Chevrolet Suburban 2026 SUV LT RWD 61,209.40$          63,459.40$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 61,192.00$                                  66,138.00$                                  No Bid
C8D Chevrolet Suburban 2026 SUV Commercial 4X4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C8E Chevrolet Suburban 2026 SUV LS 4X4 61,209.40$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 61,192.00$                                  66,138.00$                                  No Bid
C8F Chevrolet Suburban 2026 SUV LT 4X4 63,957.40$          66,207.40$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 63,940.00$                                  68,886.00$                                  No Bid

5%

General Motors
Sedans - SUVs- Cross

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may 
have not been released at the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

Gregg Young Auto Group Sid Dillon Chevrolet

4% No Bid

Husker Auto Group
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Current 

Production 
Year

TRIM Drive

C9 Chevrolet Express 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine
C9A Chevrolet Express 2500 Reg Passenger 2026 1LS RWD 44,736.65$                                   42,986.65$                                   No Bid No Bid 46,166.00$                                   44,498.00$                                   
C9B Chevrolet Express 2500 Reg Passenger 2026 1LT RWD 46,236.50$                                   44,486.50$                                   No Bid No Bid 45,682.00$                                   44,014.00$                                   
C9C Chevrolet Express 3500 Reg Passenger 2026 1LS RWD 45,073.50$                                   43,323.50$                                   No Bid No Bid 44,835.00$                                   43,167.00$                                   
C9D Chevrolet Express 3500 Reg Passenger 2026 1LT RWD 46,569.50$                                   44,819.50$                                   No Bid No Bid 46,015.00$                                   44,347.00$                                   
C9E Chevrolet Express 3500 Extended Passenger 2026 1LS RWD 46,196.50$                                   44,446.50$                                   No Bid No Bid 45,959.00$                                   44,291.00$                                   
C9F Chevrolet Express 3500 Extended Passenger 2026 1LT RWD 48,223.00$                                   46,273.00$                                   No Bid No Bid 47,138.00$                                   45,470.00$                                   
GM5 GMC Savana 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine

GM5A GMC Savana 2500 Reg Passenger 2026 1LS RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 46,466.00$                                   44,698.00$                                   
GM5B GMC Savana 2500 Reg Passenger 2026 1LT RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45,982.00$                                   44,214.00$                                   
GM5C GMC Savana 3500 Reg Passenger 2026 1LS RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45,135.00$                                   43,367.00$                                   
GM5D GMC Savana 3500 Reg Passenger 2026 1LT RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 46,315.00$                                   44,547.00$                                   
GM5E GMC Savana 3500 Extended Passenger 2026 1LS RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 46,259.00$                                   44,491.00$                                   
GM5F GMC Savana 3500 Extended Passenger 2026 1LT RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47,438.00$                                   45,670.00$                                   
C10 Chevrolet Express 2500 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine

C10A Chevrolet Express 2500 Reg Cargo 2026 1WT RWD 39,969.15$                                   38,169.15$                                   No Bid No Bid 39,527.00$                                   37,859.00$                                   
C10B Chevrolet Express 2500 Extended Cargo 2026 1WT RWD 41,686.15$                                   39,886.15$                                   No Bid No Bid 41,245.00$                                   39,577.00$                                   
C10C Chevrolet Express 3500 Reg Cargo 2026 1WT RWD 43,139.65$                                   41,339.65$                                   No Bid No Bid 42,698.00$                                   41,030.00$                                   
C10D Chevrolet Express 3500 Extended Cargo 2026 1WT RWD 43,862.65$                                   42,062.65$                                   No Bid No Bid 43,421.00$                                   41,753.00$                                   
GM6 GMC Savana 2500 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L GAS V8 4.3L V6 engine

GM6A GMC Savana 2500 Reg Cargo 2026 1WT RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 39,827.00$                                   38,159.00$                                   
GM6B GMC Savana 2500 Extended Cargo 2026 1WT RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 41,545.00$                                   39,877.00$                                   
GM6C GMC Savana 3500 Reg Cargo 2026 1WT RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42,998.00$                                   41,330.00$                                   
GM6D GMC Savana 3500 Extended Cargo 2026 1WT RWD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 43,721.00$                                   42,053.00$                                   

General Motors 
Vans

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that 
may have not been released at the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

Husker Auto GroupSid Dillon ChevroletGregg Young Auto Group

4% 5%No Bid
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C11 Chevrolet Colorado 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus 2.7L TurboMax N/A 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus 2.7L TurboMax N/A 2.7L Turbo 2.7L Turbo Plus 2.7L TurboMax N/A
C11A Chevrolet Colorado Crew Short 2026 Truck WT 2WD No Bid No Bid 30,955.00$               30,584.00$        30,584.00$           30,584.00$               No Bid No Bid 30,726.00$               
C11B Chevrolet Colorado Crew Short 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid 34,070.00$               33,911.00$        33,911.00$           33,911.00$               No Bid No Bid 34,052.00$               
C11C Chevrolet Colorado Crew Short 2026 Truck WT 4WD No Bid No Bid 34,304.00$               33,633.00$        33,633.00$           33,633.00$               No Bid No Bid 33,775.00$               
C11D Chevrolet Colorado Crew Short 2026 Truck LT 4WD No Bid No Bid 37,119.00$               36,960.00$        36,960.00$           36,960.00$               No Bid No Bid 37,102.00$               
C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel

C12A1 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Reg 6'6" 2026 Truck Work Truck 2WD 32,648.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 32,157.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 32,396.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
C12A2 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Reg 6'6" 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C12B1 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Reg 6'6" 2026 Truck WT 4WD 36,330.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 35,840.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 36,079.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid
C12B2 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Reg 6'6" 2026 Truck LT 4WD Not Available No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12C1 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck WT 2WD 32,834.00$        35,514.00$           No Bid No Bid 32,344.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid 32,583.00$        35,178.00$           No Bid No Bid
C12C2 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C12D1 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck WT 4WD 36,517.00$        39,197.00$           No Bid No Bid 36,023.00$        38,713.00$           No Bid No Bid 36,265.00$        38,860.00$           No Bid No Bid
C12D2 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck LT 4WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12E Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Double 6'6" 2026 Truck LT 2WD 38,635.00$        41,315.00$           No Bid 43,940.00$                                          39,640.00$        42,332.00$           No Bid 43,608.00$                                  40,149.00$        42,774.00$           $ 44,019.00$                                  
C12F Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Double 6'6" 2026 Truck LT 4WD 41,041.00$        43,721.00$           No Bid 46,346.00$                                          42,043.00$        44,734.00$           No Bid 46,010.00$                                  42,286.00$        44,881.00$           $ 46,156.00$                                  
C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel

C12G Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Crew 5'8" 2026 Truck LT 2WD 40,721.00$        43,400.55$           No Bid 45,430.55$                                          41,727.00$        44,418.00$           No Bid 45,118.00$                                  41,658.00$        44,253.00$           $ 45,528.00$                                  
C12H Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Crew 5'8" 2026 Truck LT 4WD 43,127.00$        45,806.55$           No Bid 47,836.55$                                          44,133.00$        46,825.00$           No Bid 47,534.00$                                  44,064.00$        46,659.00$           $ 47,934.00$                                  
C12 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel 2.7L TurboMax 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 6.2L EcoTec3 V8 3.0L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel
C12I Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Crew 6'6" 2026 Truck LT 2WD 40,994.00$        43,674.00$           No Bid 46,299.55$                                          42,000.00$        44,692.00$           No Bid 45,968.00$                                  41,931.00$        44,526.00$           $ 45,801.00$                                  
C12J Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Crew 6'6" 2026 Truck LT 4WD 43,401.00$        46,081.00$           No Bid 48,706.55$                                          44,403.00$        47,095.00$           No Bid 48,371.00$                                  44,337.00$        46,932.00$           $ 48,207.00$                                  

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that 
may have not been released at the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
4% 1% 5%

Gregg Young Auto Group Sid Dillon Chevrolet Husker Auto Group

General Motors
Light Duty Trucks
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C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13A Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45,046.00$  54,146.00$                                         
C13B Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck LT 4WD 46,299.00$  55,390.00$                                         46,043.00$  54,934.00$                                         47,654.00$  56,754.00$                                         
C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C13C Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Double 6'9" 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45,758.00$  54,858.00$                                         
C13D Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Double 6'9" 2026 Truck LT 4WD 47,011.00$  56,102.00$                                         47,303.00$  56,173.00$                                         48,366.00$  57,466.00$                                         
C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C13E Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Double 8' 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 45,939.00$  55,039.00$                                         
C13F Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Double 8' 2026 Truck LT 4WD 47,192.00$  56,283.00$                                         46,755.00$  55,646.00$                                         48,548.00$  57,648.00$                                         
C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C13G Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Crew 6'9" 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47,589.00$  56,689.00$                                         
C13H Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Crew 6'9" 2026 Truck LT 4WD 49,023.00$  58,114.00$                                         48,533.00$  57,423.00$                                         50,197.00$  59,297.00$                                         
C13 Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8
C13I Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47,770.00$  56,870.00$                                         
C13J Chevorlet Silverado HD 2500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck LT 4WD 57,814.30$  66,905.30$                                         49,767.00$  58,658.00$                                         50,378.00$  59,297.00$                                         
C14 Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C14A Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 46,133.00$  55,233.00$                                         
C14B Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 Reg 8' 2026 Truck LT 4WD 47,386.00$  56,477.00$                                         47,130.00$  56,021.00$                                         48,740.00$  57,840.00$                                         
C14 Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C14C Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 Double 8' 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 47,026.00$  56,126.00$                                         
C14D Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 Double 8' 2026 Truck LT 4WD 48,280.00$  57,371.00$                                         48,023.00$  56,914.00$                                         49,635.00$  58,735.00$                                         
C14 Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8 6.6L V8 Gas 6.6L Duramax® Turbo-Diesel V8

C14E Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 Crew 6'9" 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48,676.00$  57,776.00$                                         
C14F Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 Crew 6'9" 2026 Truck LT 4WD 49,929.00$  59,020.00$                                         49,673.00$  58,564.00$                                         51,284.00$  60,384.00$                                         
C14G Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck LT 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 48,857.00$  57,957.00$                                         
C14G Chevorlet Silverado HD 3500 Crew 8' 2026 Truck LT 2WD 50,110.00$  59,201.00$                                         49,853.00$  58,744.00$                                         51,466.00$  60,566.00$                                         

4% 1%
Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or 

that may have not been released at the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

General Motors
Heavy Duty Trucks

Gregg Young Auto Group Sid Dillon Chevrolet Husker Auto Group

5%
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C19 Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Special Service 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine
C19A Chevorlet Silverado 1500 Special Service 2026 Truck 2WD No Bid No Bid No Bid
C19B Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Special Service 2026 Truck 4WD 42,628.85$                          42,583.00$                          42,812.00$                          
C20 Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Police Pursuit 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine 5.3L EcoTec3 V8 engine

C20A Chevrolet Silverado 1500 Police Pursuit 2026 Truck 4WD 46,209.00$                          45,663.00$                          45,892.00$                          
C21 Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine

C21A Chevrolet Tahoe Special Service 2026 SUV 4WD 47,879.00$                          52,589.00$                          52,155.00$                          
C22 Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine 5.3L V8 engine

C22A Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit 2026 SUV 2WD 45,772.00$                          49,753.00$                          49,315.00$                          
C22B Chevrolet Tahoe Police Pursuit 2026 SUV 4WD 48,520.00$                          52,493.00$                          52,063.00$                          
C23 Chevrolet Express Transport Van 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine 4.3L V6 engine 6.6L gas V8 engine

C23A Chevrolet Express Transport Van 2500 2026 Regular RWD No Bid No Bid 36,753.00$                          38,397.00$                   44,698.00$                          46,466.00$                   
C23B Chevrolet Express Transport Van 3500 2026 Regular RWD No Bid No Bid 39,933.00$                          41,767.00$                   43,367.00$                          45,135.00$                   
C23C Chevrolet Express Transport Van 3500 2026 Extended RWD No Bid No Bid 40,653.00$                          42,487.00$                   44,491.00$                          46,259.00$                   

C24 Chevrolet Blazer EV Police Pursuit SUV 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay 50-amp /100-amp 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay 50-amp /100-amp 20-amp relay 30-amp/ 40-amp relay 50-amp /100-amp
C24A Chevrolet Blazer EV Police Pursuit Vehicle 2026 SUV 43,220.00$                          43,220.00$                   43,220.00$           43,553.00$                          43,553.00$                   43,553.00$           43,487.00$                          44,187.00$                   45,112.00$           

General Motors
Emergency Services

Electric Vehicle 

Gregg Young Auto Group Sid Dillon Chevrolet Husker Auto Group

5%1%4%
Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed 

above or that may have not been released at the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP



Bid Code Make Model
Year or Current 

Production 
Year

Body style Trim 
Level Drive

F1 Ford Bronco Sport 1.5L Eco boost 2.0L Eco boost
F1A Ford Bronco Sport 2026 SUV 4x4 4x4 29,451.00$        32,147.00$        
F3 Ford Escape 1.5L Eco Boost 2.0L Eco boost

F3A Ford Escape 2026 SUV Active FWD 25,897.00$        28,757.00$        
F3B Ford Escape 2026 SUV Active AWD 27,301.00$        32,954.00$        
F4 Ford Explorer 2.3L Eco Boost 3.0 L Eco Boost

F4A Ford Explorer 2026 SUV Active RWD  $        32,185.00 48,680.00$        
F4B Ford Explorer 2026 SUV Active 4x4 36,746.00$        50,948.00$        
F5 Ford Expedition 3.5L Eco Boost N/A

F5A Ford Expedition 2026 SUV XLT 4x2 52,580.00$        
F5B Ford Expedition 2026 SUV XLT 4x4 58,050.00$        

Ford 
SUV's

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may 
have not been released at the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
No Bid

Anderson Auto Group



Bid 
Code Make Model Roof Length

Year or 
Current 

Production 
Year

Trim Drive Series

F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6
F7A Ford Transit Low Reg 2026 Cargo RWD 150 41,826.00$  44,726.00$  
F7B Ford Transit Low Reg 2026 Cargo AWD 150 45,446.00$  48,346.00$  
F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6

F7C Ford Transit Low Reg 2026 Cargo RWD 250 42,868.00$  45,766.00$  
F7D Ford Transit Low Reg 2026 Cargo AWD 250 46,348.00$  49,248.00$  
F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6

F7F Ford Transit Low Reg 2026 Cargo RWD 350 43,961.00$  46,861.00$  
F7G Ford Transit Low Reg 2026 Cargo AWD 350 47,531.00$  50,431.00$  
F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6

F7H Ford Transit Reg Long 2026 Passenger RWD 250 No Bid No Bid
F7I Ford Transit Reg Long 2026 Passenger AWD 250 No Bid No Bid
F7 Ford Transit 3.5L V6 3.5L Eco V6
F7J Ford Transit Low Extended 2026 Passenger RWD 350 51,592.00$  54,852.00$  
F7K Ford Transit Low Extended 2026 Passenger AWD 350 55,793.00$  58,693.00$  

Ford
Vans

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may have not been 
released at the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
5%

Anderson Auto Group



Bid 
Code Make Model Cab Bed

Year or Current 
Production 

Year
Body style Trim Drive

F9 Ford Mavrick  2.0L Eco Boost 2.5L Hybrid
F9A Ford Mavrick Super 54" 2026 Mid size Truck XL AWD  $ 26,999.00  $     29,512.00 
F9B Ford Mavrick Super 54" 2026 Mid size Truck XL FWD  No Bid 27,998.00$  
F10 Ford Ranger 2.3L EcoBoost 2.7L Eco Boost 3.0 Eco Boost

F10A Ford Ranger Super Crew 5' 2026 Truck XL 4x2  $ 28,647.00  No Bid  No Bid 
F10B Ford Ranger Super Crew 5' 2026 Truck XL Part- time 4x4 34,240.00$   No Bid  No Bid 
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10A Ford F150 Reg 6-1/2' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2  No Bid  No Bid  $ 33,187.00  No Bid 
F10B Ford F150 Reg 6-1/2' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4  No Bid  No Bid  $ 39,956.00  No Bid 
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10C Ford F150 Reg 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2  No Bid  $ 33,171.00  $ 36,690.00  $ 35,897.00 
F10D Ford F150 Reg 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4  No Bid 38,372.00$  41,187.00$  41,395.00$  
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10E Ford F150 Super Cab 6-1/2' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2  No Bid  $ 37,987.00  $          40,187.00  $ 40,454.00 
F10F Ford F150 Super Cab 6-1/2' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4  No Bid 42,987.00$  45,375.00$  45,895.00$  
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10G Ford F150 Super Cab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
F10H Ford F150 Super Cab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost
F10I Ford F150 SuperCrew 5-1/2' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2  No Bid  $ 38,987.00  $          41,767.00  $ 42,545.00 
F10J Ford F150 SuperCrew 5-1/2' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4  No Bid 44,259.00$  48,386.00$  48,987.00$  
F10 Ford F150 3.3L V6 2.7L Eco Boost 5.0L V8 3.5L V6 Ecoboost

F10K Ford F150 SuperCrew 6-1/2' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
F10L Ford F150 SuperCrew 6-1/2' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4  No Bid  No Bid 46,605.00$  46,897.00$  

Ford
Light Duty Trucks

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may have not been released at the 
time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
5%

Anderson Auto Group



Bid Code Make Model Cab Bed

Year or 
Current 

Production 
Year

Body 
style Trim Drive

F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel
F11A Ford F250 Reg 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 41,790.00$                                   43,084.00$                                   51,079.00$                                   52,987.00$                                   
F11B Ford F250 Reg 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 44,812.00$                                   46,206.00$                                   55,498.00$                                   56,554.00$                                   
F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F11C Ford F250 SuperCab 6-3/4' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 41,015.00$                                   No Bid 52,987.00$                                   53,355.00$                                   
F11D Ford F250 SuperCab 6-3/4' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 47,707.00$                                   49,101.00$                                   57,393.00$                                   59,649.00$                                   
F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F11E Ford F250 SuperCab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 44,187.00$                                   No Bid 54,987.00$                                   55,685.00$                                   
F11F Ford F250 SuperCab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 47,888.00$                                   49,282.00$                                   57,574.00$                                   59,230.00$                                   
F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F11G Ford F250 Crew Cab 6-3/4' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 46,015.00$                                   47,015.00$                                   55,587.00$                                   57,457.00$                                   
F11H Ford F250 Crew Cab 6-3/4' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 49,771.00$                                   51,165.00$                                   59,457.00$                                   61,113.00$                                   
F11 Ford F250 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel
F11I Ford F250 Crew Cab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 46,847.00$                                   47,987.00$                                   56,997.00$                                   57,987.00$                                   
F11J Ford F250 Crew Cab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 49,957.00$                                   51,351.00$                                   59,643.00$                                   61,299.00$                                   
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12A Ford F350 Reg 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 42,015.00$                                   43,315.00$                                   51,547.00$                                   53,969.00$                                   
F12B Ford F350 Reg 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 45,990.00$                                   47,384.00$                                   55,676.00$                                   57,332.00$                                   
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12E Ford F350 SuperCab 6-3/4' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 42,081.00$                                   No Bid 52,367.00$                                   No Bid
F12F Ford F350 SuperCab 6-3/4' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 48,875.00$                                   50,269.00$                                   58,961.00$                                   60,217.00$                                   
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12G Ford F350 SuperCab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 45,315.00$                                   No Bid 54,889.00$                                   56,989.00$                                   
F12H Ford F350 SuperCab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 49,066.00$                                   50,460.00$                                   58,752.00$                                   60,408.00$                                   
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12K Ford F350 Crew Cab 6-3/4' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 47,777.00$                                   48,987.00$                                   56,588.00$                                   No Bid
F12L Ford F350 Crew Cab 6-3/4' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 50,944.00$                                   52,388.00$                                   60,630.00$                                   62,286.00$                                   
F12 Ford F350 6.8L V8 Gas 7.3L V8 Gas 6.7L V8 Diesel 6.7L V8 High output Diesel

F12M Ford F350 Crew Cab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x2 47,987.00$                                   49,192.00$                                   57,108.00$                                   58,987.00$                                   
F12N Ford F350 Crew Cab 8' 2026 Truck XLT 4x4 50,125.00$                                   52,519.00$                                   60,811.00$                                   62,467.00$                                   

Ford 
Heavy Duty Trucks

Anderson Auto Group

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may have not been released at 
the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
5%



Bid Code Make Model
Year or Current 

Production 
Year

Body style Drive

FP1 Ford Police Interceptor Utility 3.3L HEV AWD 3.3L  V6 FFV AWD 3.0L EcoBoost® AWD
FP1A Ford Police Interceptor Utility 2026 SUV AWD 42,788.00$                                   42,788.00$                                   45,352.00$                                   
FP2 Ford F150 Police Responder 3.5L EcoBoost® V6

FP2A Ford F150 Police Responder 2026 Truck 4x2 No Bid
FP2A Ford F150 Police Responder 2026 Truck 4x4 46,187.00$                                   
FP3 Ford F150 SSV 3.5L Power Boostv6 Hybrid 3.5L Ecoboost V6 5.0L V8

FP3A Ford F150 SSV 2026 Truck 4x2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FP3B Ford F150 SSV 2026 Truck 4x4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FP4 Ford Expedition /MAX SSV 3.5L Eco Boost V6

FP4A Ford Expedition SSV 2026 SUV 4x2 No Bid
FP4B Ford Expedition SSV 2026 SUV 4x4 51,987.00$                                   
FP4C Ford Expedition Max SSV 2026 SUV 4x2 No Bid
FP4D Ford Expedition Max SSV 2026 SUV 4x4 55,687.00$                                   
FP5 Ford Transit Prisoner Transport 3.5L Eco Boost V6 3.5L V6

FP5A Ford Transit Prisoner Transport 2026 VAN AWD 88,235.00$                                   85,820.00$                                   

FORD
Emergency Services

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or 
that may have not been released at the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP
5%

Anderson Auto Group



Bid 
Code Make Model

Year or 
Current 

Production 
Year

Body 
style

Trim 
Level Drive

T1 Toyota Camry 2.5 L 4 Cyl 2.5 L Hybrid
T1A Toyota Camry 2026 Sedan LE AWD No Bid 31,047.00$            
T1B Toyota Camry 2026 Sedan LE FWD No Bid 29,605.00$            
T2 Toyota Corolla 2.0L 4 Cyl 1.8L Hybrid

T2A Toyota Corolla 2026 Sedan LE FWD 23,113.00$              24,789.00$            
T2B Toyota Corolla 2026 Sedan LE AWD No Bid 26,058.00$            
T3 Toyota Corolla Hatchback 2.0L 4 Cyl 1.8L Hybrid

T3A Toyota Corolla Hatchback 2026 Sedan SE FWD 25,225.00$              No Bid
T4 Toyota Prius hybrid 2.0 L Gas/ Electric

T4B Toyota Prius hybrid 2026 Sedan LE FWD 28,604.00$              
T5 Toyota Prius Prime (PHEV) 2.0 L Plug in Hybrid

T5A Toyota Prius Prime (PHEV) 2026 Sedan SE FWD 33,886.00$              
T6 Toyota RAV4 (gas) 2.5L 4 Cyl

T6A Toyota RAV4 (gas) 2026 SUV LE FWD 31,004.00$              
T6B Toyota RAV4 (gas) 2026 SUV LE AWD 32,349.00$              
T7 Toyota bZ4X (BEV) Electric Motor

T7A Toyota bZ4X (BEV) 2026 SUV XLE FWD 36,712.00$              
T7B Toyota bZ4X (BEV) 2026 SUV XLE AWD 38,743.00$              
T8 Toyota Highlander (gas) 2.4L 4 cyl 2.5L Hybrid

T8A Toyota Highlander (gas) 2026 SUV LE FWD No Bid No Bid
T8B Toyota Highlander (gas) 2026 SUV LE AWD No Bid No Bid
T9 Toyota 4Runner 4.0L v6

T9A Toyota 4Runner 2026 SUV SR5 2WD 42,021.00$              
T9B Toyota 4Runner 2026 SUV SR5 4WD Part-time 43,911.00$              
T10 Toyota Sienna 2.5 L 4 Cyl

T10A Toyota Sienna 2026 Van LE FWD 40,170.00$              
T10B Toyota Sienna 2026 Van LE AWD 42,071.00$              

Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed above or that may 
have not been released at the time of this bid.

NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP

Toyota 
Sedan, SUV, Van

4%

Gregg Young Auto Group



Bid 
Code Make Model Cab Bed

Year or 
Current 
Producti
on Year

Body 
style Trim Drive Gregg Young Auto 

Group

T11 Toyota Tundra I Force V6
T11A Toyota Tundra Double 6.5 ft 2026 Truck SR RWD 40,893.00$            
T11B Toyota Tundra Double 6.5 ft 2026 Truck SR 4WD 40,628.00$            
T12 Toyota Tundra I Force V6

T12A Toyota Tundra Double 8.1 2026 Truck SR RWD 38,192.00$            
T12B Toyota Tundra Double 8.1 2026 Truck SR 4WD No Bid
T13 Toyota Tundra I Force V6

T13A Toyota Tundra Crew 5.5 ft 2026 Truck SR RWD 39,703.00$            
T13B Toyota Tundra Crew 5.5 ft 2026 Truck SR 4WD 45,418.00$            
T14 Toyota Tacoma I Force 2.4L

T14A Toyota Tacoma Xtra 6 ft 2026 Truck SR RWD 32,836.00$            
T14B Toyota Tacoma Xtra 6 ft 2026 Truck SR 4WD 35,919.00$            
T15 Toyota Tacoma I Force 2.4L

T15A Toyota Tacoma Xtra 5 ft 2026 Truck SR RWD No Bid
T15B Toyota Tacoma Xtra 5 ft 2026 Truck SR 4WD No Bid
T16 Toyota Tacoma I Force 2.4L

T16A Toyota Tacoma Double 6 ft 2026 Truck SR RWD 34,562.00$            
T16B Toyota Tacoma Double 6 ft 2026 Truck SR 4WD 37,607.00$            

Toyota 
Trucks

4%
Provide a standard percentage (%) discount for additional Manufacturer Models not listed 

above or that may have not been released at the time of this bid.
NOTE: DISCOUNT PERCENT (%) SHALL BE OFF OF CURRENT MANUFACTURER MSRP


